
GOOD WORK DONE BY RPF DURING THE YEAR-2024 

02.01.24 OPERATION AMANAT 
On 02.01.2024, a passenger namely Navin Kumar, working as Assitt. Loco Pilot 
under ASN division was travelling in Train No. 03681 Ex Andal to CRJ. During de-
boarding at Chittaranjan Railway station he mistakenly left behind his one blue 
coloured trolley bag in the said train. On getting information officer of RPF Post 
Jasidih attended the train and recovered the bag. Thereafter said bag was brought 
to RPF Post Jasidih. After sometime Rajshekhar, relative of he said passenger 
appeared at RPF Post Jasidih and after identification of the bag containing used 
cloths, 01 Gold Mangalsutra, 02 Gold lockets & Other cosmetic items, total valued 
Rs. 1,05,000/- was handed over to him after proper documentation and 
acknowledgement. 

02.01.24 OPERATION AMANAT 
On 02.01.2024 a RailMadad complaint regarding left behind of a bag in Train No. 
18619 Up Godda Intercity Exp, Coach No. S-4. On receipt such complaint on duty 
officer of RPF PostDumka attended the train on arrival at Dumka station and 
recovered a bag and brought to RPF PostDumka for further disposal. On checking 
one Laptop, One charger, One Head Phone, Clothes & One ATM were found inside 
the bag. The matter was informed to SCNL/ASN as well as the complainant. On 
02.01.2024 one person namely Pawan Kumar Gupta  S/O Uday Kumar Gupta Vill-
Lohhar Muhhala, Tandwa, Garhwa, Jharkhand, PIN-822114, Mob No: 9608039938 
came to RPF Post Dumka  and reported that one bag containing one Laptop worth 
of Rs. 35000/-, One charger worth of Rs. 3000/-, One Head Phone worth of Rs. 
1000/-, Clothes worth of Rs. 2000/- approx  & One ATM. Total value  Rs. 41000/- 
which he had been left behind in train no. 18619 Godda Intercity Exp, in Coach 
no. S-4 and submitted a written application and a Xerox copy of School identity 
card and demanded his left behind articles. After proper verification and obtaining 
acknowledgement, the recovered item was handed over to him with all correct. 

 
03.01.24  Medical assistant to pregnant lady under Operation SEVA:-  

On 03/01/2024 getting information from SCNL/Asansol regarding attending S8 of 
Train No. 12312 Dn where at about 06/00 hrs. T/No. 12312 dn. (Kalka Mail) 
arrived at Asansol on PF. No. 5 of Asansol rly station and  Asi/Ramanuj singh with 
lady constable Pooja Patel of west post attended the same and de-boarded one 
female passenger from Coach No. S-8 due to she having labour pain  inside the 
train namely Tajmira Bibi (F-28), w/o Asit Mallick of Kaliganj, Mokampara, Nadia 
(WB) 741150 who was travelling from NDLS to BWN  vide pnr.2635883679. by 
Tran No. 12312 with her son Moiddin 06 yrs. Immediately officer informed to Dy. 
SS/ Asansol and arranged the wheel chair and send to the SD. Hospital at about 
06/37 hrs. by ambulance with the help of lady constable of RPF and GRPS/Asansol 
where she is under treatment,  admitted and give a female new baby born with 
mother and baby both are healthy under Dr. Nandita. In this regard matter 
informed to her mother Rubia over mob. 9339516380 and they were reached at 



SD. Hospital by road from Bardhman. In this connection a memo issued by Dy. 
SS/ Asansol vide no. Nil dtd. 03/01/2024 at 05/30 hrs. 

 
03.01.24 OPERATION NANHE FARISTEY 

On 03.01.2024, getting information of a Rail Madad complaint regarding missing 
of one girl aged about 10 yrs, officers & staff of West Post/ASN conducted a check 
at PF area and noticed the girl wandering aimlessly with a minor boy at PF No. 4 
of ASN near ramp. On being asked they identified themselves as Kashak Kumari,  
F/14 yrs  D/O Anand Kr Singh of Khagariya, Dist- Munger, Bihar and Ram Kumar, 
M/15  Yrs, S/O Uma Singh of Jakhor, PS-Barhaiya, Dist- Lakhisarai, Bihar and 
informed that they fled away from their residence on 02:1:2024 /AN. 
Subsequently they were handed over to Child Help Desk/ASN for further disposal 
after observing all legal formalities and their parents have been informed 
accordingly. 

 
05.01.24 Operation “NANHE FARISTE” 

On 05.01.2024 during round officer and staff of West Post/ASN noticed that four 
minor boys aged around 15 yrs. wandering aimlessly at PF No: 5 of ASN Station 
near TXR office. On being asked they identified themselves as 1.Manirul Islam, 
M/14 yrs, S/O Rafikul Islam, 2. Shahid Ali, M/17 yrs, S/O Babu Ali, 3. Shakib 
Mandal M/14 yrs, S/O Shahidul Mandal and 4. Alamgir, M/16 yrs, S/O Jakir 
Hussain of Maliakur, P. S- Duttapukur, Dist- 24 Parganas( N)  WB and informed 
that they fled away from their residence with an intention to go to Ajmer. 
Accordingly informed to Child Help Desk/ASN Rly Station and their father and 
subsequently they were handed over to Child Help Desk/ASN for further disposal 
after observing all formalities. Submitted please. 

05.01.24 Operation “DIGNITY” 
On 05.01.2024 one girl aged about 18 yrs. was handed over to Ashray (SUH) , 
Depo para, ASN for shelter and further disposal. For last few days she was often 
noticed roaming aimlessly at ASN Rly Station and sometimes she was provided 
food by passengers/persons. On being asked the girl couldn't tell anything except 
her name as Laxmi Kumari. She was seemed to be mentally stabled. As the Rly 
station was a vulnerable place and as she has no shelter, she was handed over to 
said shelter home considering her dignity and safety. 

09.01.24 Operation “Amanat” 
On 09.01.2024 information was received from SCNL/ASN regardingleft behind of a 
laptop of a passenger, who was travelling in train No. 12333 UP, Coach No. B2, 
Berth No. 16 from Howrah to Durgapur. Accordingly on arrival of said train at 
Chittaranjan on duty officer and staff of RPF Out Post Chittaranjan attended the 
train and recovered the laptop and brought to RPF/OP/CRJ. Later on 10.01.2024 
one person namely Palash Saha, S/O- Prodyut Saha of North Ramkrishnapur, 
Dhanyashisha, PS-Bishnupur, Dist-24 Parganas (South). West Bengal), 743503 
came to RPF/OP/CRJ and stated that he was deboarded at Durgapur Station but 
his laptop bag was left behind, mistakenly. After proper verification and 



documentation the left behind laptop was handed over to actual owner. Value of 
the recovered Laptop is Rs.50,000/-. 

 
10.01.24 Operation SATARK:- 

On 10.01.2024, information was received from SCNL/ASN that escort party of 
T/No 12023 (Jansatabadi Express) were detected 03 nos. unclaimed bag 
containing country liquor and handed over to RPF Post Jasidih. The bag containing 
1) 06 Nos. of “Royal Stag” of 750 ml. each value Rs. 740/-, 2) 08 Nos. of Officer’s 
Choice of 500ml. each, Value Rs. 390/- 3) 04 bottles of Officer’s Choice of 375 ml, 
each value 300/-, 4) 20 bottles of “Officer’s Choice” of 180 ml, each value Rs. 
150/- 5) 06 bottles Old Monk of 180 ml, each value Rs. 150/- 6) 10 bottles “60◦ 
Up Mistic” of W. Bengal product of 600 ml, each value of Rs. 130/-, 7) 02 nos. of 
Can Beer of Heineken of 500 ml, each value of Rs. 120/-Total quantity  21.680 
Litter and Total valued Rs- 14,200/-Hence, the liquor has been seized under 
proper seizure list in presence of available witnesses and brought to 
RPF/Post/Jasidih. The seized liquor werehanded over to Excise Department 
Deoghar. 

 
18.01.24 Operation “SEWA” 

 On 18.01.2024information was received from SCNL/ASN regarding one male 
passanger was filling illness in Train No. 22611 UP, GS coach No. 203749 (2nd 
from train engine).After getting information officer and staff of RPF Post Andal 
(OL), on duty staff of GRPS/UDL and on duty poter attended the trainon arrival at 
Andal Station and the illness passeger was brought to Rly Hospital/Andal for 
treatment. After check up and primarily  treatment by DMO/UDL shifted to 
SD/Hospital/DGR in male medical Ward, Bed No. 31 for better treatment. 

20.01.24 OPERATION AMANAT 
On 20.01.2024, information regarding left behind of a bag by one person namely 
Ankit Kumar, s/o Monoj Kumar Gayatrinagar, Vill-Tandbalidih ward no. 10 
Bandhdih, Bokaro (JH)-829301, having mob No.9304276327 on PF No. 04 of 
Asansol Railway Station. The bag was recovered by the officer of RPF Post Asansol 
(West) and brought to RPF Post Asansol (West). Accordingly, the person attended 
RPF Post Asansol (West) and demanded the bag containing one Lenovo Laptop, 
charger, one steel Milton water bottle and yellow coloured file, one book, one 
diary with cash Rs 2000/- etc. total valued Rs 50,000/. After proper verification 
and documentation the bag was handed over to the actual owner with all correct. 

 
20.01.24 Operation Yatri Suraksha 

 On 20.01.24 in the night during joint round checking and raid against 
unauthorised person by the officers & staff of RPF Post Barakar with GRPS/ASN 
noticed one person namely Satish Kr. Paswan, S/O - Rajesh Kr. Paswan of 
Karimdangal, Barakar, near Dipodangal Gyatri Mandir, PS-Kulti Dist- Paschim 
Bardhaman who was trying to hide himself in suspicious manner. On further 
searching 02 nos. of unclaimed Android mobile Phones without SIM and with 



pattern lock valued Rs. 20000/- found from his possession and also found that 
there are many cases registered at GRPS/ASN against the accused person. The 
person was arrested and mobile phones were seized. In this connection a case 
vide No. 02/24 Dtd: 20.01.24 U/S 379/411/414 IPC has been registered at 
GRPS/ASN. 

 
22.01.24 Operation “Nanhe Fariste” 

On 22.01.2024, during round, officer and staff of RPF Post Jasidih noticed that 
three minor boys were roaming aimlessly at PF No. 01 of Jasidih Station. On being 
interrogation, they revealed their identities as 1) Dhan Singh Bhatt, M (11 years), 
S/O- Laxman Bhatt, R/O- Damukari, Barabani gate, PS- Domohani Bazar, Dist- 
Bardhman, W.B, 2) Mohit Bhatt, M (13 years), S/O- Suraj Bhatt, R/O- Damukari, 
Barabani gate, PS- Domohani Bazar, Dist- Bardhman, W.B., 3) Raj Kumar Bhatt, M 
(14 years), S/O- Laxman Bhatt, R/O- Damukari, Barabani gate, PS- Domohani 
Bazar, Dist- Bardhman, W.B and also stated that they were fled away from their 
home due to family discord. Accordingly, rescued minor boys were brought to RPF 
Post JSME and three minor boys were handed over to Childline/Deoghar for care 
and protection after proper documentation and acknowledgment. 

  
02.02.24 Operation “Matrishakti” 

On 02.02.2024 information was received from on duty SM/CRJ as well as 
SCNL/ASN regarding one female passenger namely Surekha Kumari, aged-25 yrs. 
travelling by Train No.18105 UP, Ex-ROU to DBG, S-3, Berth No. 53, PNR No-
6231084258, suffering from labour pain. The train arrived at CRJ station at about 
04.25 hrs. On duty officer and staffs of RPF/OP/Chittaranjan, GRPP/CRJ with SM 
and Porter attended the said coach and de-boarded the said female from the train 
and send to KG Hospital/CRJ. The said female admitted in Female ward Bed 
No.06, under treatment by Dr. Sayan. Her husband namely Shankar Shaw, Ph/No-
9709208974 was accompany with her.  Later she was transferred to S. D. 
Hospital/ASN where she gave birth a baby. Now baby and mother are in well 
condition. 

05.02.24 Operation “AMANAT” 
On 05.02.2024, a passenger namely Md. Ilyas, S/O- Gul Mohamad, R/O- Sahin 
Bagh, Jamia Nagar, Delhi was travelling in Train No. 22347 from HWH to PNBE. In 
course of journey when the said train stopped at ASN Railway station, he de-
boarded from the train for collecting food items. In the meantime the train started 
and the door was automatic closed. Unfortunately, he couldn’t board in the train 
and his luggage has been left behind in Coach No.C-7, Berth No. 36 of the said 
train. On getting information, officer and staff of RPF Post JSME attended the 
coach and recovered the luggage. Accordingly, recovered luggage was brought to 
RPF Post JSME. After sometime, one person namely Md. Ilyas appeared at 
RPF/Post/Jasidih and his trolley bag containing new & used cloths, Cooling fan & 
one laptop bag containing 01 Laptop Total Valued Rs. 50,000/- was handed over 
to him after proper documentation and acknowledgement. 



05.02.24 Operation “SATARK”  
On 05.02.2024, CIB/ASN conducted a raid and drive in Train No.13287 UP from 
Asansol Railway Station to Madhupur Railway Station. During drive when the train 
left from CRJ station, CIB/ASN team detected 03 Nos. pitthu bags & 01 hand bag 
containing 53 Nos. bottles of different liquor which were lying in front of door of 
coach attended cabin in suspected condition in AC coach No. M-1 as unclaimed. 
Accordingly, several persons asked but nobody came forward to claim the same. 
On arrival of the said train at MDP station, CIB team detrained all liquor at MDP 
station and all the bags opened and found (i) 25 Nos. Impreial Blue ( 750 ml & 
value Rs. 640/-each, T/Value- 16,000/- ) (ii) 05 Nos. Old Monk XXX Premium Ram 
( 750 ml & value Rs. 560 each, T/Value Rs. 2,800/-) , (iii) 11 Nos. Blenders Pride 
whiskey ( 750 ml & value Rs.980/- each, T/Value Rs.-10,780/-) & (iv) 12 Nos. 
Royal Stag whiskey (750 ml & value Rs.740/-each, T/Value Rs.-8,880/-), G/Total 
Value Rs. 38,460/-. Seized the all liquor in presence of available witnesses, no 
independent witness came forward to witness the seizure. Later the seized liquor 
handed over to RPF/Post/MDP for further disposal. After observing all legal 
formalities, seized liquor bottles are forwarded to Excise Department/ Deoghar 
(JH) for further action. 

06.02.24 Operation “DIGNITY” 
On 06.2.2024during duty officer and staff of RPF Post Asansol(W) noticed that one 
lady was moving near main gate of Asansol Rly station in distressed condition. On 
being asked she identified herself as Karishma Kumari, F/18 yrs. D/O Mahesh 
Sharma of Nongarh, Tetarhat, Lakhisarai, Bihar-811311 and informed that as her 
parents expired during childhood, she was work as domestic help in a house at 
Asansol, where she stayed but due to some problem she left that place and she 
doesn’t want to return there. As she has no alternative safe shelter. Accordingly, 
she was handed over to Ashray/Dipo Para/Asansol for her safety & dignity after 
observing all formalities. 

07.02.24 Operation “NANHE FARISTE” 
On 07.02.2024 during duty officer and staff of RPF Post Asansol (W) noticed that 
one minor boy was moving suspicious at PF No. 5of ASN Rly station and on being 
asked he disclosed his identified as Prince Prasad aged 11yrs S/O Shambhu Prasad 
of Bandle Manaspur Eden Park No. 8, PS-Bandle Dist Hooghly West Bengal Pin 
712123 and also he stated that he flew away from his Grandmother residence, 
Patna (Bihar) .Brought him to RPF POST ASN West. The matter was informed to 
Rly Child Helpline, Asansol and the minor boy was handed over to Rly Child line 
Asasnol. 

12.02.24 Operation  SATARAK:-  
On 12.02.2024, during routine checking by on duty camping staff at PF No.02 of 
VDS Rly Station Train No. 18185 UP (Godda Wickly Exp) arrived at PF No. 02 at 
21:15 hrs.  at VDS railway station, when he noticed that two persons were 
boarded at VDS Station in rear disable compartment with four bags(Jholas) in 
suspicious condition. On being asked they disclosed their identity as (1) Sourav 
Yadav (M-18 yrs.) S/O Lt. Jageswar Yadav R/O Vill-Palbagan Mihijam, PS. Mihijam, 



Dist. Jamtara, Jharkhand &( 2.) Kartick Yadav, (M-19 Yrs.) S/O Sapindar Yadav 
R/O Vill- Vill. Palbagan Mihijam, PS. Mihijam, Dist. Jamtara, Jharkhand.  On being 
checked their bags (Jholas) and found that four bags (Jholas) were full of liquors 
but they did not give any satisfactory reply or produced any legal authority in this 
regard. After that detained persons were brought at RPF/Post/Jamtara. On duty 
officer seized 10 nos. Imperial blue big 750 ML each value 640/- and 35 nos. 
Imperial blue Small 375 Ml each value 330/- from possession of Sourav Yadav (M-
18 yrs.) S/O Lt. Jageswar Yadav R/O Vill-Palbagan Mihijam, PS. Mihijam, Dist. 
Jamtara, Jharkhand and with seized 39 nos. Imperial blue Small 375 Ml each value 
330/- & 01 no. officer Choice country 750 ML value 570/- & 02 Nos. Old Mock 
small 375 ML each value 290/- & 04 Nos. Old Monk big 750 Ml each value 560/- 
from possession of  Kartick Yadav, (M-19 Yrs.) S/O Sapindar Yadav R/O Vill- 
Palbagan Mihijam, PS. Mihijam, Dist. Jamtara, Jharkhand Total seized 39.750 liters 
and value Rs. 34,210/- in proper seizure list in presence of available witnesses at 
RPF/Post/Jamtara. They were taken into custody for committing offence of 
carrying liquors in train illegally. The arrested persons were kept under custody at 
RPF/Post/JMT. On date 13.02.2024 arrested persons with seized articles and 
relevant papers are being handed over to Excise department, Jamtara for its 
further legal disposal. 

14.02.24 Operation AMANAT:-  
On 14.02.2024, a passenger namely Jitendra Gupta, R/O- Hondda, Chhapya, UP 
was travelling in T/No. 03634 Ex Sultanganj to Deoghar. When the said train 
arrived at Deoghar Railway Station he de-boarded and mistakenly left behind his 
one laptop bag containing Laptop in the train. On duty officer of RPF Post JSME 
was on round and during his round he recovered the said laptop bag and 
conveyed this amongst the passengers but no one came forward to claim it. 
Accordingly, recovered laptop bag was brought to RPF Camp Deoghar. After 
sometime, Jitendra Gupta appeared at RPF Camp Deoghar for enquired about his 
bag. After identification of the said laptop bag containing Dell company Laptop, 
Valued Rs. 38,000/- was handed over to him after proper documentation and 
acknowledgement. 

22.02.24 Operation “Yatri Suraksha” 
On 22.02.2024, during duty officer and staff of RPF Post JSME noticed that one 
person in suspicious condition, who started running after seeing uniform 
personnel, but he was chased and caught at PF No. 01 of Jasidih Station. On 
being interrogation, he disclosed his identity as Roshan Kumar Nunia, M/19 yrs., 
S/O- Lt. Dharmendra Nunia, R/O- Vill- Nidha Imlidhora, PS- Jamuria, Dist- 
Bardhwan, W.B.,while on being searched found one Samsung Company Mobile 
Phone Galaxy M-01 Core, has been recovered. On asking about this phone, he 
could not give any satisfactory answer which was stolen from railway passenger. 
Accordingly, the arrested person with recovered stolen mobile phone were 
brought to RPF Post JSME and handed over to GRPS/Jasidih for further legal 
action.  In this regard a case has been registered at GRPS/Jasidih vide Case No. 
18/2024 dtd 22.02.2024 U/S 414 IPC. 



 
25.02.24 Operation “AMANAT”  

On 25.02.2024 information was received from SCNL/ASN regarding left behind a 
Pithu Bag of a passenger in Train No.12383 (Sealdah Intercity Express). 
Accordingly, officer and staff of RPF Post Raniganj attended the train on arrival at 
Raniganj Station and recovered the Pithu Bag. The recovered Pithu Bag was 
handed over to the actual owner namely Shivam Prasad Gupta S/O Surendra 
Prasad Gupta. The bag containing one laptop make Dell, cash Rs.3,500 and other 
valuable documents total valued is Rs.1,50,000/-(approx.). 

 
01.03.24 Operation “NANHE FARISTE” 

On 01.03.2024 during duty officer and staff of RPF Post UDL(OL) noticed that one 
minor boy was de-boarded from Train No.12323 (Barmer SF Exp) at Andal Railway 
station without parents. On interacting he revealed his name as Md. Rehan (M-13 
year) S/O Md. Jainul Uddin, now at  Vill- Post office Goli, Tapsia Road, Dist- 
Howrah(W.B) and his permanent address was Ward No- 11, Chak Hakim tolaBaro 
Bazar,Dist- Begusarai, Bihar, 851118 and also he stated that the child resides with 
his father in Kolkata and he had escaped from his house without consent of his 
father and was going to meet to his mother in his native village in Bihar.  
Accordingly he was brought to RPF Post Andal(OL) and handed over to Child Line 
Asansol for further legal action. 

05.03.24 Operation “NANHE FARISTE” 
On date 05.03.2024 during round officer and staff of RPF Post Asansol (W) noticed 
that 01 minor boy aged about 10 yrs. moving aimlessly on PF No. 7 of Asansol 
Railway Station. Seeing this detained him and on being asked he disclosed his 
name as Dinesh Tanti, S/O Somnath Tanti but couldn't provide his address. 
Accordingly, informed to Childline/Asansol. After that the rescued boy was handed 
over toChildline/Asansol for further legal action. 

 
06.03.24 Operation “Rail Suraksha” 

On 06.03.2024, during duty officer and staff of RPF Post Jasidih noticed that that 
a person in suspicious condition, who started running fast after seeing uniform 
personnel, but he was chased and caught at PF No. 01 at Rail Pole No. 322/30 by 
RPF/CIB,ASN who were performing special watch, TP/PS and TOPB duty 
respectively. On being interrogation, he disclosed his identity as Rajman Chauhan, 
M (22 years), S/O- Shipujan Chauhan, R/O- Vill- MaithanHodla, PS- Solanpur, PO- 
KaniyariSarif, Dist- West Burdhman, West Bengalwhile doing his personal search, 
found 1) One sky colored Apple Company Mobile, 2) One Dark Blue colored Redmi 
Company Mobilehave been recovered. On asking about these phones, he could 
not give any satisfactory answer which were stolen from railway passenger. 
Thereafter, arrested person with recovered stolen mobile phones were brought to 
RPF Post JSME. After that the arrested person along with mobile phones was 
handed over to GRPS/Jasidih for further legal action.  In this regard a case has 
been registered at GRPS/Jasidih vide Case No. 21/2024 dtd 06.03.2024 U/S 414 



IPC. 
 

06.03.24 Operation “SATARK” 
 On 06.03.2024 during roundofficer and staff of RPF/OP/CRJ at Chittaranjan 
Station and noticed that 02 Nos. hand bags was kept as unclaimed in suspicious 
manner near FOB at Chittranjan Railway Station. Being suspicious it was searched 
and found that 150 no's Mac-Dowells Celebration, each-180 ml. value Rs.-130/-
,Total value Rs.-19,500/-. Hence, the liquors were seized under proper seizure list 
the spot with available witnesses as unclaimed. After that the seized liquors were 
handed over to Excise department, Jamtara under proper documentation for 
further legal disposal. 

 
07.03.24 Operation “AMANAT” 

On 07.3.2024 one person namely SujoyBouri, S/O DipakBouri of Ramchandrapur, 
P.S- Santuri ,Dist- Purulia attended RPF/West post Asansol and reported  that on 
06.3.2024 while he was travelling from ASN to  Purulia, he left behind his one 
black coloured bag (Nikon) containing 2 handicam cameras of Panasonic full HD 
with 04 batteries & 1 memory card ( valued Rs 60,000/- approx ) on the concrete 
sitting area at PF No:2. In this connection CCTV footage was checked and it was 
observed that the bag was collected by an out sourcing staff and deposited to 
GRPS office ASN as unclaimed property found at PF No. 02., the bag was traced 
out and handed over to the actual owner on 08.3.2024 after proper verification & 
observing all formalities under written undertaking.  
 

08.03.24 Operation “Jeevan Raksha”On 08.03.24 hrs.  ASI/K.Halder/a/w 05 staffs of 
RPF Post Durgapur were detailed for T/E duty in T/NO- 12352DN.EX- JSME to 
DGR to keep special watch on boarding &deboarding of passengers. While the 
train started moving to departure Madhupur Station at 02:19 hrs. but in the 
twinkling of an eye one person tried to board the S1 while the train was running 
motion and they were standing at the adjoining gate. But the person slipped and 
lost his balance. Consequently he was hanging from the gate and his body 
entangled in the gap of train and platform. Seeing this critical situation CT/A.K.Sah 
immediately reached the said gate and hold his both hand. He tried every trick in 
the book to pull out him but the said person was unable to board the train. Seeing 
this situation ASI/K. Halder immediately applied ACP to stop the train  from S-1 
Coach. After that he was pulled out from that gap and made him sit on a berth. 
They noticed his pant went torn and he got injured in his both legs. On being 
asked he disclosed his name Virendra Kumar Gupta and he was travelling from 
BaktiarPur to Hawrah in S 2 berth No 16 having PNR No. - 6231544570. He was 
asked what was the reason for his deboarding? He answered that he deboarded to 
buy a water bottle from the platform shop. In the meantime, the said train was 
started. That's why he tried to board the said running train. In this regards a 
written application was taken from him wherein he mentioned the whole matter. 
Two eye witness also put their signature in it and gave their PNR &Moible number. 



Victim demanded medical treatment before us. After that on duty TTE informed 
concerning department. Accordingly, doctor came to Asansol and medical 
treatment was provided him. On being enquired from T/guard it came to know 
that train suffered detention from 02/20 hrs to 02/22hrs. 
 

12.03.24 Operation “Jeevan Raksha”On 08.03.24 hrs.  ASI/K.Halder/a/w 05 staffs of 
RPF Post Durgapur were detailed for T/E duty in T/NO- 12352DN.EX- JSME to 
DGR to keep special watch on boarding &deboarding of passengers. While the 
train started moving to departure Madhupur Station at 02:19 hrs. but in the 
twinkling of an eye one person tried to board the S1 while the train was running 
motion and they were standing at the adjoining gate. But the person slipped and 
lost his balance. Consequently he was hanging from the gate and his body 
entangled in the gap of train and platform. Seeing this critical situation CT/A.K.Sah 
immediately reached the said gate and hold his both hand. He tried every trick in 
the book to pull out him but the said person was unable to board the train. Seeing 
this situation ASI/K. Halder immediately applied ACP to stop the train  from S-1 
Coach. After that he was pulled out from that gap and made him sit on a berth. 
They noticed his pant went torn and he got injured in his both legs. On being 
asked he disclosed his name Virendra Kumar Gupta and he was travelling from 
BaktiarPur to Hawrah in S 2 berth No 16 having PNR No. - 6231544570. He was 
asked what was the reason for his deboarding? He answered that he deboarded to 
buy a water bottle from the platform shop. In the meantime, the said train was 
started. That's why he tried to board the said running train. In this regards a 
written application was taken from him wherein he mentioned the whole matter. 
Two eye witness also put their signature in it and gave their PNR &Moible number. 
Victim demanded medical treatment before us. After that on duty TTE informed 
concerning department. Accordingly, doctor came to Asansol and medical 
treatment was provided him. On being enquired from T/guard it came to know 
that train suffered detention from 02/20 hrs to 02/22hrs. 

 
14.03.24 OPERATION SATARK:- 

 On 14.03.24 Train escorting party of train No. 13186 down Ganga Sagar handed 
over one Mohit Kumar with a trolley bag to RPF Post Asansol West. It is alleged 
that Mohit was found in B-6 of train No. 13186 without ticket, suspected to be a 
TOPB criminal. Interrogation at RPF Post west reveals name and address of that 
person is Mohit Kumar (M/21 yrs.) S/O-Avdesh Kumar of vill- Nimarang, P.O+P.O- 
Jamui, Bihar. He boarded in 13186 down from Jhajha and was to take the trolley 
bag to Howrah. As checked found the trolley containing Rs. 50 lacs. Mohit could 
not disclose much about the money. He told that some Jimmy of Jamui had given 
him the bag and at Howrah someone was to collect it from him. As asked about 
the owner Mohit could only mention about some Gourav, building contractor of 
Patna whom he never meet. For further disposal Income Tax department from 
Asansol branch is called and with a complaint to Dy.Director Income Tax Asansol 
the detained person Mohit with the cash Rs. 50 lacs is handed over to Dy. Director 



Income Tax Asansol. The cash is seized from the possession of Mohit by IT 
department vide section 132 IT Act for further necessary action U/S 143&147 IT 
Act. Mohit is released by IT Department with a summon to appear at the office of 
IT at Asansol on 20.3.24 for further enquiry. 

20.03.24 Operation AMANAT:- 
On 08.03.2024, one passenger namely AritraSenGupta, who was travelling by 
Train no. 22307 Up (HWH Bikner Express) from HWH to DDU vide PNR 
No.6903071445 had left behind the purse of his wife containing Samsung mobile 
(S-10), passport of his child, PAN Card, and 07 ATM card in the train. Accordingly, 
the said purse was recovered by the Train Escort party of the train and deposited 
to RPF West Post Asansol. On 20.03.2024, the passenger attended RPF Post 
Asansol (West) and demanded the purse worth Rs. 75,000/-.  After verification the 
recovered purse containing the above articles was handed over to him. 
 

01.04.24 OPERATION JIVAN RAKSHA 
On 01.04.2024,Train No. 11447 DN arrived at 21:16 hrs. at PF-2 & left at 21.19 
hrs. while the train wasstarted and running from KMME PF suddenly one 
passenger came from outside and tried to board in the train but slipped and came 
down at the gap between PF and train. On duty RPF staff of RPF Post Barakar, 
HC/S. Ram & CT/S.K. Maurya rushed the PO and pulled him out. He was shouting 
"please save me”, his right hand got almost separated near elbow and was 
bleeding badly. Matter was informed to on duty SM/KMME, he provided stretcher 
and issued a memo in this regard but denied to provide any staff. On duty RPF 
staff and GRP staff took him to a nearby private hospital at KMME where First Aid 
was provided and refer to Sadar Hospital Asansol. After that ASI/R.A Singh with 
staff took him to Asansol by departmental vehicle and admitted at Sadar 
Hospital/Asansol, Male Surgical Ward Bed No. 237 for better treatment. The 
person was disclosed his identity as Palash Das, Male 39 yrs, S/O- Samir Das, C/O- 
Sabita Das, Mandal Para, PS-Das Nagar, Dist-Howrah (WB). One General ticketNo. 
32573687, dtd 01.04.2024 Ex- KMME to HWH found from his possession. 

 
02.04.24 OPPERATION NANHE FARISTE 

On 02.04.2024officer and staff of RPF Post Asansol (W) noticed that one minor 
boy namely Nitesh Kumar, M/9 yrs., S/O Punyadeo Paswan of ward No.17, Vill- 
Khurahiya, East Chamaran, Biharwho was moving aimlessly alone on PF No. 2 of 
Asansol Railway Station and on being asked he replied that he was fled away from 
his native place on dtd. 01.04.2024 due to reprimand by his mother. The rescued 
boy was brought to the Post where after documentation handed over to Railway 
Child line Asansol for further legal action and also  informed to his father over 
mobile phone. 

 
02.04.24 OPERATION JIVAN RAKSHA 

On 02.04.24, a train no. 12303 arrived on PF no. 03 of Durgapur Railway Station 
at about 09:50 hrs. After its scheduled stoppage the train started departing at 



09:59 hrs. When the train had picked up the momentum, one lady passenger ran 
towards the train and tried to board into the moving train but unfortunately lost 
her balance due to her heavy weight and was about to fall into the gap between 
the running train and the platform. But, on duty platform staff LC/S.L.Sutar of 
RPF/Post/Durgapur acted promptedly and pulled up the subject lady and saved 
her life from getting gripped into an unfortunate accident. In this quick action 
LC/S. L. Sutar lost her own balance resulting  which she fell on the platform and 
got scant injured. In ths regard, the identity details of the subject lady could not 
be obtained 

04.04.24 Operation “AMANAT” 
On 04.04.2024, a passenger namely Roshan Kumar, S/O- Gautam Prasad, R/O- 
Kanchan Sadan, Ramchandrapur, Jasidih, Deoghar, Jharkhand was travelling in 
T/No. 12362 , Coach No. B1, Berth- 42 from DDU to JSME. During journey, when 
the said train arrived at Jhajha Railway station, he got dawn from the said train for 
some reason. At the mean the train departed from the station and his one bag 
containing wearing cloths, documents & Lenovo Laptop left behind in the said train. 
Immediately, he informed this matter to on duty RPF staff. On getting information 
from on duty seal checking staff of JAJ, SI/P.K.Rao of RPF Post JSME came in 
prompt action and attended the said train and succeeded in recover the said bag. 
On 04.04.2024, Roshan Kumar appeared at RPF Post JSME and the recovered bag 
containing wearing cloths, documents & Lenovo Laptop (Valued: Rs. 100000/-) 
was handed over to him after proper documentation and acknowledgement. 
 

13.04.24 OPERATION JEEVAN RAKSHA  
On 13.04.2024, at about-15.00 hrs. Train No.11448 up arrived at PF No-3 of 
Durgapur Station and left at 15.15 hrs. in the meantime one lady person trying to 
board in the running train and she was fell down and her body went in the gap of 
platform and train, where due to prompt action of on duty RPF staff namely 
HC/6349 Samir Bandyopadhyay pulled out the lady and also lost his balance and 
fell down on the platform and sustained minor injury. On being asked the lady  
was disclosed her identity as Sushila Das, F-67 yrs., W/O- Lt. Arjun Prasad,R/O-
Ouarter No.75,Kurpaniya More, Sunday Bazar, Bokaro, Barmo, PS-Gandhinagar, 
Distt-Bokaro, State-Jharkhand, 829127, due to brave efforts by on duty RPF staff 
she managed to save her life. Due to such incident she got slight injury on her 
body. 

 
14.04.24 Operation “AMANAT” 

On 14.04.2024, a passenger namely Niraj Kumar Singh, S/O- Lt. Maheswar Prasad 
Singh, R/O- Barh, Patna, Bihar was waiting for train at Jasidih Railway station for 
travel from Jasidih to Bokaro. While waiting he slept near main gate of Jasidih 
Railway station and his mobile phones fell out of the pocket in sleep. HC/Bijay 
Kumar of RPF Post JSME was performing Baggage Scanner duty at main gate of 
Jasidih Railway station. He recovered the said mobile phones and convey it among 
the passengers but no one came forward to claim it. After that said mobiles were 



brought to RPF/POST/JSME. Accordingly, Niraj Kumar appeared at RPF Post JSME 
for enquired about his phones and said recovered mobiles i.e. One Oppo company 
android mobile & One Moto 5G mobile (Total Valued: Rs. 36,000/-) was 
handed over to him after proper documentation and acknowledgement. 
 

15.04.24 Operation “Rail Prahari” 
 On 15.04.2024 at about 15.32 hrs. SI/MDP/D. Prasad reported that one old aged 
person entered into the portico of Madhupur Station, behind him some persons 
followed him carrying lathi also entered into the portico and started beating the 
old aged person very rudely. Noticed such type activity, officers and staff of 
RPF/Post/MDP attended the portico but the persons engaged in beating the old 
aged person managed to flee away. Accordingly RPF personnel of RPF/Post/MDP 
with the help of GRP/MDP admit the victim to Referral Hospital Madhupur and 
further shifted to Sadar Hospital Madhupur for better treatment. Further gathering 
the details of the persons involving in such activity the following information came 
into knowledge that victim namely Nasuriddinhn Seikh,  of Dohri, PS- 
Margomunda, Madhupur, Dist- Deoghar Jharkhand was attacked by some persons 
namely (i) Salim Seikh, M-30, S/O- Safruddin Seikh, (ii) Javed Seikh M-23 S/O- 
Rahim Sekh, (iii) Chakra Sekh M-30 S/O- Lt Maqbool Sekh, (iv) Saddam Seikh M- 
30, S/O- Sultan Seikh all of Lalgarh, PS- Madhupur, Dist-Deoghar and 02 person 
one Salim’s father in law and another was brother in law. The injured person's son 
namely Raja Seikh M-21 S/O Nasuriddinhn Sekh of Dohri, PS- Margomunda, 
Madhupur, Dist- Deoghar Jharkhand submitted a written complainto OC/GRPS 
against such Act, on the basis of such written complain GRPS/MDP registered a 
Case Vide No. 03/2024 dtd. 15.04.2024 U/S-341/323/307/379/506/34 IPC against 
the above persons at GRPS/Madhupur. 

16.04.24 Operation “MATRISHAKTI” 
On16.04.2024 at about 04.15 hrs. getting information from on duty Dy. SS/ASN 
regarding a passenger namely Sita Choudhury (F-25 years) W/O Akhilesh, Mob 
No. 6372070846, delivered a new born baby on PF No.06  near Pay & use Toilet at 
Asansol Rly Station, They have journey by train no.18449 Puri Patna Exp Vide 
Ticket No. 95484664. Accordingly, officers and staff of West Post ASNand GRPS 
ASN attended the spot and she was shifted to SD Hospital Asansol by Railway 
ambulance with assistance by LHC Jhuma Ray of RPF West Post Asansol. She was 
admitted to female Ward Bed No.29 under the treatment of Dr. Bansi 
Vishal.SM/ASN issued a memo in this regard. 

 
21.04.24 Operation“JEEVAN RAKSHA” 

On 21.04.2024, T/No. 13121 UP arrived at PF No. 03 of Durgapur Stationat 22:17 
hrs. and left at  22:21 hrs. but suddenly stopped due to ACP in Coach No. 222545. 
(M-1). Accordingly officers and staff of RPF Post Durgapur attended the train and 
it came to know that 01 person while boarding in the sleeper Coach having PNR 
No. 6434345394 has fallen down on platform and entered into the gap between 
edges of the platform and the train, that's why one passenger having PNR No. 



6532490252 of (M-1) Coach applied ACP for save his life. Immediately, on duty 
staff of RPF Post Durgapur, HC/ T.Sinha and LC/Asima Das pulled the fallen 
passenger and save his life. Identity of the passenger as Sanjoy Kumar Pandey, 
M/39Yrs.. S/O, Jogeshwar Kr. Pandey, Vill- Parshagar, Chapra, PS- Ekma, Dist- 
Chapra,  Bihar. Accordingly matter has been enquired with the CCTV footages of 
DGR Railway Station which corroborated the above facts.In this regard a memo 
has been issued by on duty T/Guard and mentioned that rectified by TM and due 
this incident the train suffered detention from 22:21 hrs. to 22:28 hrs. i.e. 07 
minutes. As the matter was genuine, no case has been registered at RPF Post 
Durgapur. 

 
26.04.24 Operation “AMANAT” 

On 26.04.2024, a passenger namely Pankaj Kumar Sah was travelling in T/No. 
12351, Coach No. B-7, Berth No. 18. During journey when the said train arrived at 
Madhupur Railway station, he alighted at platform for filling water bottle. At the 
meantime the said train started and he could not board in the train and his 
luggage left behind in the train and informed to RPF Post JSME. On getting such 
information ASI/Kamlesh Kumar of RPF Post JSME attended the train and 
recovered the luggage. After sometime one person namely Pankaj Kumar Sah 
appeared at Post and the recovered luggage i.e. one grey colour backpack 
containing wearing cloths, Medicines, Documents & Laptop (Valued: Rs. 50,000/-) 
was handed over to him after proper documentation and acknowledgement. 

 
29.04.24 OPERATION “JEEVAN RAKSHA” 

On 29.04.2024 at about 19.20 hrs., Train No. 13021(UP)  Mithila Exp. arrived at 
PF No.02 of Durgapur Railway Station. While the train left at about 19.22 hrs. 
from DGR Station and picked up the momentum in the meantime one passenger 
attempt to board in running train but  lost his balance and dropped down in the 
gap of platform edge and running train. On seeing this on duty officer 
ASI/T.K.Laha and LC/Sikha Yadav  as well as on duty  IC of TE duty of the train 
ASI/K.Kishor of RPF Post Durgapur take quick response and pulled out to him and 
save his life. On being asked he disclosed his identity as Rajeev Singh, M/54 yrs. 
S/OLate Avadhesh Singh, R/O. Vill—Solahpur, P.O-Bara, P.S.-Chandradip, Dist.-
Jamui, Bihar having UTS No. 428MDRUIA4. EX. Durgapur to Jasidh Railway 
Station. On being asked he stated that he is well and no any need of medical 
assistance. 

 
01.05.24 Operation “NANHE FARISTE” 

On 01.05.2024 during round, ASI Md. Altafuddin noticed that one minor child (girl) 
aged about 04 years moving suspicious at ASN PF No. 5 near RMS office of ASN 
Rly Station. On ground of suspicion the girl was detained and on being asked the 
minor girl was disclosed her identity as Nima, D/O Basant of Kotshila, Jhalda, Dist-
Purulia, West Bengal and also informed that she came to ASN with her sister but 
her sister left her at ASN PF 5 and flew away from ASN. Subsequently, the minor 



girl was handed over to Rly Child Help Desk, ASN for further disposal after 
observing all formalities. 

 
01.05.24 Operation “NANHE FARISTE” 

On 01.05.2024, a minor girl aged about 06-07 years was roaming aimlessly near 
Kalka end, Foot Over Bridge of Platform No. 03 of Durgapur Railway Station. 
Accordingly, officer and staff of RPF Post Durgapur detained the girl and on being 
asked she disclosed her identity as Kushi Giri, D/O. Bijay Shankar Giri, Mother 
name Manisha Giri, R/ O. Vill. Mathiya, Danigiri, Dist. Ballia. U.P. She also 
disclosed that she has ran away from her home without any information. 
Accordingly, the rescued girl was handed over to Childline Asansol under proper 
documentation and photography for legal action. 
 

 
02.05.24 Operation “NanheFariste 

On 02.05.2024 at about 11:30 hrs. information received from Chiranjit Pal, TM-3 
PWI/PAN that they were engaged in their working between KM No. 151/20-22  
near LC Gate No. 99 saw that 04 minor aged boys were running in DN-02 line 
towards Mankar Station. Immediately they stopped & rescued them and kept 
them LC Gate 99 A/E and informed to RPF/Post/Panagarh. On getting such 
information on duty officer of RPF/Post/Panagarh rushed to the place and take 
over the charge of 04 Nos, minor child and brought them RPF/Post/Panagarh and 
informed to the Child Line/Asansol for further disposal. On interrogation of the 
child it has been come to the light that namely (i) Gulam Warrish (M-09 Yrs), S/O-
Wahid of Bhawanand, Giridih (ii) Hasan Raju Ansari (M-07 Yrs), S/O- Javed Ansari 
of ofBhawanand, Giridih (iii) Sajid Ansari (M-13 Yrs), S/O- Wali Mohammad of 
Kherpoka, Giridih and (iv) Sahid Ansari (M-10 Yrs), S/O- Wali Mohammad of 
Kherpoka, Giridih were fleeing away  from a local Madrasa due to physical torcher. 
After receivedinformation, 02 members of Child Line Asansol namely Anupam 
Chakraborty (Case Worker) and Ram Saha (Supervisor) came to 
RPF/Post/Panagarh at 18:00 hrs. After completion of all legal formalities said 04 
Nos. minor child handed over to the above Child Line Team/Asansol at 18.45 hrs 
with proper documentation.  

 
05.05.24 Operation AMANAT 

On 05.05.2024 received an information from SCNL/ASN regarding left behind a 
ladies bag in T/No. 12332 DN. On duty officer and staff attended the train GS 
coach at Chittaranjan Railway Station and could be able to recover the ladies bag. 
After due verification and documentation the subject bag has been handed over to 
her. Recovered items were Cash of Rs.10,200/-, one old Mobile phone, toys, some 
silver jewelleries and clothes. Total Value of the recovered property is Rs.30,200/-. 

 
06.05.24 Operation Under NARCOS:-  

On 06.05.2024 SI/Shyam Das of RPF/Post/Howrah (Central) along with 04 RPF 



staff were escorting of Train No.12311 Up (Netaji Express) Ex- HWH to DHN. 
During train escorting duty when the train was in between DGR and ASN noticed a 
check violet colour bag kept in the Berth No. 28 of Coach No. S-9 of that train. On 
being checked the bag found 02 nos of plastic packet containing dry leaf (seems 
to be Ganja) (i) weight of first packet is 3.3 kgs and (ii) weight of second packet is 
3.4 kg total weight of 02 nos packet is 6.7 kgs. Accordingly SI/ Shyam Das seized 
the materials under proper seizure list in presence of available witness and 
brought down the material at ASN and with the assistance of 
RPF/POST/ASN(WEST), SI Shyam Das handed over the seized article to 
GRPS/Asansol where a case vide no.21/2024 dtd-06.05.2024 U/S 20 (b)(ii) (B) 
NDPS Act. Valued Rs.1.02 lakh. 

 
08.05.24 Operation Yatri Suraksha 

On08.05.2024, during special watch duty against TOPB criminal’s officer and staff 
of RPF Post Jasidih noticed,while the Train No. 28182 arrived at Jasidih Railway 
Station hear screaming of “Chor-Chor” from Coach No. S-2 of the Train. On 
hearing, HC/A. K. Pathak visited the coach and on being asked from passenger 
namely Kaiser Ali, M (43 yrs), S/O- Md. Munna, R/O- Sakin-Salim Nagar, Mahesh 
Khutt Khagariya vide PNR No. 6535292719, said that the ladies purse of his wife 
was stolen by a unknown person and hide in the bathroom/toilet of the said 
coach. Accordingly, HC/A.K. Pathak informed to ASI/Kamlesh Kumar with such 
concern. Immediately, they reached to the PO and with the several try, the 
suspected person opened the toilet gate and was having a ladies purse which was 
declared by the passenger that it was his wife and taken by him. After that, 
ASI/Kamlesh Kumar insisted or tried to convince him to lodge FIR but the said 
passenger refused due to medical appointment of his wife but he gave a written 
application in this regard. Accordingly, the culprit was brought to RPF Post JSME 
for further interrogation. On being asked, he disclosed his identity Prahlad 
Kumar, M (27 yrs), S/O- Vinod Kumar Verma, R/O- Jai Nagar, Lal Pahari, 
PS- Kabiya, Dist- Lakhisarai, Bihar and while doing his personal search, found 
i) One Brown-Black coloured VIVO Mobile, ii) One Samsung Galaxy A34 Mobile, iii) 
One Silver coloured Samsung Mobile in Switch off mode and liquid cash Rs. 
35,200/- which has been recovered. On asking about these phones and cash, he 
could not give any satisfactory answer and he also could not able to unlock the 
phone. Accordingly he confessed that he has stolen the said mobile phones and 
liquid cash from the Railway passengers.The arrested person with recovered 
stolen mobile phones & liquid cash were handed over to GRPS/Jasidih for further 
legal action. In this regard a Case has been registered at GRPS/Jasidih Vide Case 
No.41/2024 dtd 08.05.2024 U/S 414 IPC.  

 
08.05.24 Operation- Amanat 

On 08.05.2024, received a Rail Madad complain Reference No. 2024050807473, 
regarding left behind of one light brown colour bag in 3rd compartment from rear 
Guard Brake Van attached with T/No. 03682 Dn., having UTS ticket No. 



XX6DSHOID, Ex. JSME to MDP. Immediately officers and staff of RPF Post 
Sitarampur attended the said train on arrival at STN Railway station and recovered 
the same and inform to SCNL/ASN as well as complainant to collect his bag from 
RPF/Post/STN. Later one person came to RPF/Post/STN and claimed the bag. On 
being asked he disclosed his identity as Suman Saurabh, S/O Shri Dhirendra 
Mahato, R/O Vill. Charghar, P.O. + P.S. Sarwan, Dist. Deoghar. The bag 
containing (1) I phone 12 value, (2) Samsung Galaxy, (3) Bank Passbook, ATM 
Card, Cheque Book, Voter ID Card, PAN Card etc. Total Value of the recovered 
items is Rs. 1,00,000/-. The recovered bag with all articles were handed over to 
him after proper verification and acknowledgment. 

 
23.05.24 Operation Amanat” 

On 23.05.2024,officer and staff of RPF Post Asansol (W) recovereda Laptop Bag 
from Train No.12383 containing one Laptop (DELL), one ladies Purse and cash Rs. 
5,000/- Total valued is Rs.60,000/- and handed over to the actual owner namely 
Mainak Mandal, A/A 40yrs, S/O Late Mrinal Kanti Mandal, R/O Daffodil 308,Siddha 
Water front, PS-Rahara,Kol 700119 with proper verification and acknowledgment. 
 

25.05.24 Operation AMANAT 
On 25.05.2024, a bonafide passenger namely Rajesh Kumar, R/O-Sitarampur who 
was travelling in Train No. 12339 UP Coalfield Express and while the train was 
reaching Panagarh station at about 19:20 hours and handed over a left behind 
Apple iPhone 13 Promax mobile phone to RPF personnel at Panagarh Railway 
Station and stated that the said mobile phone was recovered from a bathroom of 
Howrah Station when he went to the bathroom. After that, a phone call was 
received by Sri Rajesh Kumar when the caller introduced himself as the actual 
owner of the said phone and disclosed his identity as Joy Karmakar (M-27 Yrs), 
R/O- 135/D, G. T. Road, Dey Bagan, PS-Serampur, Dist-Hooghly (WB) and stated 
that he had mistakenly left behind his mobile phone in the bathroom of Howrah 
Station and also requested him to hand over the said mobile phone to any RPF 
personnel of en-route station. The same has been verified with the owner of the 
mobile phone through mobile call and kept in custody for further disposal. On 
26.05.2024 the above-named Passenger appeared to this post. After proper 
verification & documentation, the recovered left behind Apple iPhone 13 Promax 
Mobile Phone, worth Rs. 1,40,000/- was handed over to its actual owner namely 
Joy Karmakar Mob No. 7980261576 in the same condition. 

 
30.05.24 Operation Sewa  

On 30.05.2024 information was received from SM/JMT regarding one ill person 
was lying at Platform No. 02 of Jamtara Station near Main gate entrance. 
Accordingly, officer & staff of RPF Post Jamtara immediately attended and 
ambulance was called and the ill person was shifted to Sadar Hospital Jamtara for 
treatment where he was admitted in Room No. 50 and Bed No. 09 under 
treatment of Dr. Rajendra Kumar Tudu.  After feeling good the person disclosed 



his identity as Nitish Das, S/O Kanu Das, Vill-Budhuwatand, P.S-Koron, Dist-
Deoghar, Jharkhand, having Mob. No 879734906. After that his family was 
informed about the matter when his brother came. Now the condition of the 
person is well. 

 
02.08.24 Operation “NANHE FARISTE” 

On 02:08:2024 on getting information regarding handing over of one child 
through Railmadad, one passenger namely Akash Prasad handed over one minor 
boy aged about 10 yrs to SI/Subhra Dey of West post/ ASN informing that the 
child was found crying in GS coach of T/no:22388 and he deboarded the child at 
ASN for further disposal. On being intercepted the boy identified himself as Rocky 
Sk. M/10 yrs, S/O Sintu Sk.  of Sitapahari, P.S+ Dist.- Pakur, JH and informed that 
he fled from his residence to meet his father at Delhi who is working  there. 
Subsequently the boy was handed over to Rly Child Help Desk/ASN for further 
disposal after observing all formalities  
 

04.08.24 Operation “NANHE FARISTE” 
On 04.08.2024, SI/P.K. Rao of RPF Post JSME a/w HC/P. Mondal was conducting 
round at Jasidih Railway Station. During round they noticed that 02 adult persons 
a/w 10 nos. minor boys were attempted to board in T. No. 03007 (HWH-KWP Spl). 
As such interrogation, they stated that all of them were taken for Madrasa 
Education purpose in consent of their parents. Accordingly, they disclosed their 
identity as 1) Hasim Ansari, M(22 yrs), S/O- Rejaual Rahman and 2) Md. Afgan, 
M(22 yrs), S/O- Md. Tajmul. Further, on interrogation with the children mentioned 
as (I) Azruddin Ansari, M(12 yrs), S/O- Sarif Ansari, R/O- Kheribani, Bansjori, 
Godda, Jharkhand (II) Mujahid Ansari, M(11 yrs), S/O-Sattar Ansari, R/O- 
Kheribani, Bansjori, Godda, Jharkhand (III) Ikram Ansari, M(9 yrs), S/O-
Mannan Ansari, R/O- Kheribani, Bansjori, Godda, Jharkhand(IV) Arbaz Ansari, 
M(13 yrs), S/O- Lalbasu Ansari, R/O- Kheribani, Bansjori, Godda, Jharkhand (V) 
Minhaj Ansari, M(12 yrs), S/O-Mujjafar Ansari, R/O- Kheribani, Bansjori, Godda, 
Jharkhand (VI) Asfaq Ahmad, M(10yrs), S/O-Majibul Ansari, R/O- Gram Raksha 
Kitta, PO-Mahagama, Godda, Jharkhand (VII) Hasib Ansari, M(12 yrs), S/O- 
Firoz Ansari, R/O- Kheribani, Bansjori, Godda, Jharkhand (VIII) Sohail Ansari, 
M(11 yrs), S/O- Kalam Ansari, R/O- Raksha Kitta, PO-Mahagama, Godda, 
Jharkhand (IX) Fahran Ansari, M(13 yrs), S/O- Ramjan Ansari, R/O- Kheribani, 
Bansjori, Godda, Jharkhand (X) Ajhar Ansari, M(12 yrs), S/O- Lt. Safid Ansari, 
R/O- Kheribani, Bansjori, Godda , Jharkhand and they stated that all of them will 
be admitted in Madrasa and they have come with the above named persons with 
the consent of their parents. Accordingly, they provided contact number of their 
parents and on asking to their parents they confessed that they sent their child in 
their own consent. Thereafter, on 05.08.2024 all the 10 nos. children a/w 02 adult 
persons were handed over to CWC/Godda for further counseling as per JJ Act 
2015.   
 



04.08.24 Operation “AMANAT” 
On 04.08.2024, a complaint was lodged regarding a missing mobile phone. Upon 
investigation, CCTV footage at Asansol was reviewed, revealing that the 
complainant's brother had accidentally dropped the phone near the barricade. A 
rickshaw puller picked up the phone, but his identity could not be ascertained due 
to poor image quality. ASI/A Pandit of RPF Post Asansol West worked on the case 
and successfully recovered the phone on 05.08.2024. The complainant, Dhanraj 
Sharma, son of Bimal Sharma, resident of Jai Narayan Sarar, Barakar, PS Barakar, 
Dist Paschim Burdwan, informed and called at RPF Post Asansol West on 
06.08.2024. The recovered phone(Apple 13 valued at Rs. 80,000/-) was 
handed over to him after proper verification. 

 
06.08.24 Operation “AMANAT” 

On 06.08.2024 train escort party of T/No. 12333 UP (Vibhuti Ex.) during escorting 
train escorting party received a Rail Madad complaint vide Ref/No.2024080606830 
through SCNL/ASN regarding a left behind Mobile Phone in coach no. S-4, berth 
no. 10 of a bonafide passenger namely Rahul Jain, PNR No. 6739798719, Mob: 
8512995557 travelling from HWH to ASN station. On receipt of information, train 
escorting party attended said coach and recovered the sameand deposited the 
same at PS-Cell/ASN. The complainant was also informed to come at PS-Cell/ASN 
to receive his left behind Mobile Phone. On 07.08.2024 the said passenger arrived 
at PS-Cell/ASN and after proper verification, the recovered Mobile phone ‘Samsung 
Galaxy Z Fold’, valued Rs.1,70,000/- approx has been handed over to him after 
proper verification. 
 

09.08.24 Operation “Yatri Suraksha” 
On 09.08.2024, officer and staff of RPF Post JSME conducted raid in civil cloths 
against TOPB criminals at Jasidih Railway Station premises as well as in trains in 
between MDP-JAJ section. During their special watch, when the train No. 12333 
arrived at about 12:10 hrs. at PF No. 02 of JSME station, noticed that a person in 
S-2 coach of siad train in suspicious manner. Accordingly, approached towards 
him and by seeing this he tried to run away. Accordingly, detain the suspected 
person near FOB of PF No. 02 by hot chasing. Accordingly, the culprit was brought 
to RPF Post JSME for further interrogation. On being asked, he disclosed his 
identity as Roshan Kumar, M (22 yrs), S/O- Bijay Mondal, R/O- Dasrathi, 
PS- Dharhara, Dist- Munger, Bihar and while doing his personal search, 
found03 nos. Mobile phones i.e. i) Dark Blue coloured Samsung Mobile, ii) White 
cream coloured Samsung Mobile phone, iii) Dark Green coloured POCO mobile 
phone (Total Value- 95000/-) found from the possession of the said culprit. On 
asking about mobile phone, he could not give any satisfactory answer and he also 
could not able to unlock the said mobile phones by entering password. Accordingly 
he confessed that he had stolen the said mobile phones from the railway 
passenger. 
             Thereafter, arrested person with recovered stolen mobile phones were 



handed over to GRPS/Jasidih for further legal action. In this regard a case has 
been registered in GRPS/Jasidih Vide Case No.74/2024 dtd 09.08.2024 U/S 317 
(5) BNS.  

 
09.08.24 Operation “Sewa” 

On 09.08.2024 acting on information received from Dy. SS/Asansol regarding 
ilness of one passenger in Train No. 11448 Up arrived at PF and on arrival of train 
at Asansol Railway station officers and staff of RPF & GRP/Asansol attended the 
train and detrained the illness passenger namely Karimul Haque (M-32), S/O 
Manjur Ali, having PNR No. 613-9910518 Ex. Howrah to Singrauli, SE 1 berath no. 
67, the said passenger suffering from loose mmotion. In this connection Dy. 
SS/ASN issued a memo vide no. 78/SM/PA/ASN/24 dated 09.08.24 at 15:55 hrs. 
The person was provided render assistance and shifted to SD Hospital, Asansol by 
Govt. Ambulance for treatment, where he admitted in Male Medicine Ward, Bed 
No. 237. 
 

11.08.24 Operation “SATARK” 

On 11.08.2024 during round officer and staff of RPF/MDP noticed that one person 
was trying to board in T/No. 08440 (Puri Special) in motion when the train started 
from PF No. 04 of Madhupur Rly Station but the person not able to board in train 
and he tried to throw his bags inside train compartment but could not succeed.  
On suspicious, the said person detained and on integration he stated that he came 
at MDP station to give luggage to his owner. Accordingly , on suspicion , he was 
asked about the bags but he could  not replied any satisfactory answer, later his 
bags was opened at PF area when found huge liquid cash in bundles rolling with 
old/used news paper. On being asked, he failed to produce any documents/ 
papers regarding the liquid cash. As such, he was brought to RPF/Post/MDP for 
further course of action. At RPF/Post/MDP he disclosed his identity as Md. Karamat 
( M-36 yrs about), S/O- Jainul Sheikh , R/O Pasiya, P.S- Madhupur, Dist- Deoghar 
(JH) and stated his owner’s name as Sushil Surekha of Shiva Rice Mill existing at 
52 Bigha , Madhupur, Dist- deoghar (JH) but he failed to other details of the 
owner. In this regard, matter has been informed to Dy. Director of Income Tax, 
Investigation Unit/Dhanbad over phone on 11.08.2024 for further action. 
Consequently, on date 12.08.2024 Addl. Income tax officer Mr. Dhaneshwar 
Mahato (emption ward Dhanbad) and staff of Investigation Unit/Dhanbad of 
Income Tax Department appeared to this post and recovered bags containing 
liquid cash, detained person were produced before Income Tax officers for further 
investigation into the case. Accordingly, the detained person (Md. Karamat) and 
owner (Sushil Kumar Surekha) were examined by the Income-Tax department and 
their statement has been recorded. However, both the bags were opened by them 
and after counted found liquid cash Rs.44,50,000/-(Rupees Forty-four lakhs and 
fifty thousand only). Presently the cash is in the custody of In-come Tax officers 



and investigation is still going. 

 
02.09.24 Operation “AMANAT” 

On 02.09.2024, officer and staff of RPF Post Jasidih recovered a Backpack from 
Train No.15625 and handed over to the actual owner. Valued is Rs.50,000/-.  

05.09.24 Operation “Nanhe Fariste” 
On 05.09.2024 officer and staff of RPF Post Asansol (W) rescued a minor girl from 
Asansol station and handed over to Child Line Asansol with proper verification.  

05.09.24 Operation “Nanhe Fariste” 
On 05.09.2024 officer and staff of RPF Asansol (W) rescued 02 nos of minor Boys 
from asansol Railway station and handed over to Asnasol Railway Child Line. 

11.09.24 Operation “SEWA” 
On 11.09.2024 an information was received from SM/Galsi that one unknown 
person was lying at KM No. 131/6 between Paraj & Galsi as reported by the Train 
Guard of E/8208/8428 BGB.Accordingly, On duty staff of RPF/Post/Panagarh 
attended the P.O. with one Porter of Galsi Station and rescued the injured person 
and brought to BMC Hospital, Burdwan for treatment.   

15.09.24 Operation “AMANAT” 
On 15.09.2024, officer and staff of RPF Out Post Chittaranjan recovered a hand 
bag (Laptop Bag) from train number. 12369 up, and found (DELL company 
Laptop), valued is Rs. 65,000/- (approx.) and handed over to the actual owner 
with proper verification.  

30.09.24 “Operation Jeevan Raksha : 
On 30.09.2024, C. Nil Rajdeep Kumar saved Barsha Gupta (23 yrs) who fell 
between train and platform while boarding departing Train 03610 at Asansol 
Station's PF 6. Prompt action prevented serious injury/death. 
 

01.10.24 Operation “SEWA” 
On 01.10.2024 Hand Ball team of Murshidabad Dist. School came from Purulia 
after participating WB State level by train and after deboarded at ASN PF 4 and 06 
nos. lady of them fell sick and first they brought to Gouri Devi Hospital PF 2. 
Accordingly, officer and staff of RPF Post Asansol(W) attended and send to SD 
hospital ASN for better treatment by railway ambulance with lady staff of RPF and 
GRP for treatment 

01.10.24 Operation “Dignity”  
On 01.10.2024 during duty officer and staff of RPF Post Jamtara noticed that a 
teenager girl wandering aimlessly at JMT station, attended her and found she was 
crying continuously. On being asked she disclosed her identity as Rajiya Tigga (F-
18 yrs.) D/O- Sri Shital Tigga, R/O-Jangalpara manipat ward no.19, P.S-Sitapur, 
Surguja , Chhattisgarh,  Pin—497111and she was from Chhattisgarh but presently 
residing with her sister in Chhitaranjan (CLW). But on 01.10.2024 she was 
missing(remember) her parents so flew away from her sister's house(CLW). 
Matter informed to her sister Sulochana Tigga and her father over mobile. After 



that the girl was handed over to Mahila thana, Jamtara for further legal action.  
03.10.24 Operation “AMANAT” 

On 03.10.2024, officer and staff of RPF Post Jasidih recovered a bag from Train 
No.12325. The bag containing Apple company hand Watch, 02 Charger, Cosmetic 
Items, Aadhar Card & Bluetooth, Valued is Rs. 60,000/- and handed over to the 
actual owner with proper verification.  

07.10.24 Operation Narcos: - 
On 07.10.2024 receivedinformation from on duty staff RPF Post Asansol(W) 
regarding lying of one white colour plastic bag at the free space near the main 
gate at Platform No. 2 of Asansol Railway station. Accordingly, officers & staff of 
RPF Post/Asansol (West) attended the spot and found the same. Seeing this 
searched the claimant but no owner came forward to claim the attended bag. 
Being suspicion, dog squad was attended and sniffed the bag, gave signal of 
narcotic items. Further on checked found 02 packets inside the bags, both the 
packets are wrapped with brown colour tape - one packet weighing of 1.045 Kgs 
& another packet weighing of 1.020 Kgs, total weight 2.065 Kgs. Both the packets 
having substance seems to be Ganja (Cannabis). Accordingly, seized the bag 
containing 02 packets Ganja (Cannabis) and prepared at the spot in presence of 
available witness.  
  All the seized items (Ganja) with relevant papers werehanded over 
toGRPS/Asansol for further legal action. Value of seized Ganja is Rs.31,000/- 
(approx). 
 

08.10.24 Operation “AMANAT” 
On 08.10.2024, officer and staff of RPF Post Madhupur recovered a bag from 
Train No.13005,containing one laptop of LENOVA and two purse in which 
containing liquid cash RS 9,820/- and another 1250/-. Accordingly, recovered 
items were handed over to the actual owner with proper verification. Total Valued 
is Rs.80,000/-.     

11.10.24 Operation “NANHE FARISTE”  
On 11.10.2024 officer and staff of RPF Out Post CRJ rescued 02 nos. boys from 
CRJ Station and handed over to Child line Deoghar for further legal action.  
 

13.10.24 Operation “YATRI SURAKSHA” 
On 13.10.2024 during round officer and staff of RPF Post Madhupur noticed a 
person jumped over the train (13508)& fallen down. Immediately a person 
jumped down from the running train. Immediately reached at ROB, where a 
person was trying to flee from the P.O. immediately a/w GRP staffs & local 
residential apprehended him. The passenger came to us & told that this person 
has taken his mobile phone. On searching found the apprehended person found a 
Vivo Company Mobile phone from the possession of apprehended person. Latter 
apprehended person with recovered mobile phone were brought to GRP/MDP for 
further legal action. Where on receiving complaint from the victim GRP/MDP 
registered a case No.- 50/2024, u/s- 304(2)/317(2) BNS.  



21.10.24 Operation “YATRI SURAKSHA” 
On 21.10.2024 during round officer and staff of RPF Post Madhupur & GRP 
officials noticed that one passenger started shouting thief-thief…..near circulating 
area. Immediately officers & staffs chased up the suspected person & 
apprehended him. On searching, one mobile phone of Realme Company with 
Mobile of RS 10,000/- recovered from the possession of apprehended person. 
During interrogation apprehended person accepted his guilt In this regard 
apprehended person was handed to GRPS/MDP where on the basis of complaint 
received from mobile owner namely Ravindra Pandit, a Case vide no - 51/2024, 
Dt. – 21.10.2024 u/s- 303(2), & 317(2) BNS registered at GRPS/MDP. 

21.10.24 Operation “SATARK” 
On 21.10.2024 receiving message from reliable sources regarding liquors in train 
no. 07051 UP, on duty officer and staff of RPF Post Madhupur & GRP MDP 
searched the coach & recovered Royal Stage (Premium Whisky) (i) 48 nos. (375ml 
each), value each 210/- & (ii) 36 nos. Royal Stage(Premium Whisky) 750ml, value 
each 420/- rupees each, total 84 nos. bottles of liquor total value Rs. 25,200/-. 
After that seized the same as unclaimed in presence of available witnesses & 
forwarded to Excise Department Deoghar by GRP/MDP for further legal process. 

29.10.24 Operation “JEEVAN RAKSHA” 
On 29.10.2024, during round officer and staff of RPF Post Jasidihrescued one 
female passenger from the gap of Station and PF. She was trying to board in 
running train no. 18184 DN and fell down in the gap of JSME Railway station and 
PF No. 01. On being asked, she disclosed her identity as Gungun Kumari, F(18 
yrs), D/O- Raj Kumar Prasad, R/O- Vill- Makmarango, PS- Birni, Dist- Giridih, 
Jharkhand and had to travel from Jasidih to Madhupur Station. 

02.11.24 Operation “NANHE FARISTE” 
On 02.11.2024, officer and staff of RPF Post Madhupur noticed that a group of 
children roaming suspiciously at MDP station area. On being asked they failed to 
say any satisfactory reply and became silence. Immediately matter informed to 
Ashray NGO working under BBA/CWC- Deoghar. After sometimes, representative 
of Ashray NGO attended RPF/Post/MDP.  During examination by the 
representative of Ashray/NGO all the children’s stated that they flew away their 
home without any intimation to family. After observing all legal formalities, the 
childrens were handed over to CWC/Deoghar through Ashray NGO.  

 
06.11.24 Operation “JEEVAN RAKSHA” 

On 06.11.2024 during round officer and staff of RPF Post Madhupur noticed that 
one passenger trying to de-board from running train intercepting the passengers 
in motion resulting which he lost his balance and hanging on the door. On seeing 
this attended and rescued the passenger was rescued.   
 

 
 

10.11.24 Operation “WILIP” 



On 10.11.2024 on the basis of source information RPF/CIB/ASN and SIB/ASN a 
raid drive contacted by them in train no.12987 up regarding carrying illegal birds 
(Wild animal) which are restricted to carrying by Indian Railway. During such drive 
they noticed that 02 iron cages were kept under the berth coach no S 3 in 
suspected condition. Firstly, they asked about actual owner of both bags but no 
any came forward to claim of both cages. Just on arrival of said train at ASN 
Station both cages brought down on platform and again they wait for its owner 
but non to came forward after several time. Hence, seized total 130 nos. 
(approx)Bulbul birds under proper seizure list in presence of available witness, 
after several request no any independent witness came forward to giving witness. 
In this regard due to fear of law further the seized birds brought to RPF/WEST 
POST/ASN for further action. The received seized birds for further disposal and 
handed over to Forest department Rupnarayanpur. 

 
12.11.24  Operation “NANHE FARISTE”  

On date 12.11.2024 at about 14.00 hrs, during round conducted by  SI/D.Prasad , 
SI/S.S.Kumar &CT/Bablu Kumar of RPF/MDP Post  at  PF No.- 3/4 near HWH/End 
FOB, MDP station, they noticed that two girls were moving aimlessly in suspicious 
manner. On being asked they failed to reply any satisfactory answer regarding 
their identification & purpose for moving in station premises. Immediately matter 
informed  to Ashray Team/Deoghar working under CWC/Deoghar. Accordingly the 
said NGO team arrived at RPF/Popst/MDP. Further on enquiry in presence of 
Deepa Kumari, Ashray Team/Madhupur the both minors disclosed their identity as 
1) Laxmi Kumari, Female- 10 Yrs, S/O-Murari Singh  M/O Draupadi.,  (ii) Saraswati 
Bhatt, F 11, S/O-Lt Chandan Bhat ,  M/O Sambai Bhatt, both residing of Bara boni 
Gate, PS:- Domahani, Dist:- Pachim Burdwan(WB). Thereafter above  both girls 
were handed over to Childline/CWC/Deoghar through above NGO for further 
process. 

 
13.11.24  Operation Ammanat:- On date 13/11/24 one person namely Niranjan Kumar m 

27 S/O Kundan Kumar of Manikapur (Sonajan) District Lakhisarai mob no 
9122628373 came to RPF West POST office and claimed his left behind blue color 
pithu bag in Kiul ASN memu. About this matter he submitted written application to 
handed over to him in which he stated that on 12/11/24 he boarded on train from 
Kiul for JSME with wife but he not deboarded there due to he hope that train will 
go to Baijnathdham .when he noticed after departure from JSME train is going 
towards MDP. Then he deboarded at Sankarpur. When he noticed that his luggage 
left behind in train then he arrived SM office and tell about the matter. After some 
time received information that bag has been recovered at ASN and kept at West 
Post office. After proper verification and documentation handed over to him left 
behind article as noted below 1)Gold Tops 17000/-, 2)Mangaluru 25000/-, 3)Ring  
18000/-, 4)Nose pin  2200/-, 5)Saree. 2200/, 6)Cash 1500/-, 7)Other article  
1000/-, Total value Rs 66,700/- 



16.11.24 “Operation Narcos”:- On dated 16.11.2024, a letter has been received by this 
post from Parcel office/MDP/E.Rly with mentioning L.No.  Nil Dt. 12.11.2024 of 
CPS/Ranchi dt. 15.11.2024 regarding search and verify the goods declared & 
booked vide 1. PRR No.- 4002051696 Ex. BSB to MDP, 10 Nos P/Bdl, containing 
Manihari Goods total weight 348.00Kg with invoice no. B1123787, party name- 
Shivam-Morena at BSB & 2. PRR No.- 4002048920 Ex BSB to MDP, 20 Nos P/Bdl, 
containing Manihari Goods total weight 642 Kg with invoice no. B1123617, party 
name- Shivam – Morena At BSB. both Ex BSB to MDP . Received at MDP station 
on dt. 14.11.2024. On dt. 16.11.2024 RPF/MDP ASI/Narendra Kumar reached at 
Parcel Office MDP where found the item is declared/mentioned in PRR as Manihari 
Goods. Then above items jointly checked in presence of Chief Parcel 
Supervisor/MDP & receiver/representatives of booked parcel namely Pranesh 
Gupta, Male- 38 yrs. about, S/o- Lt. Abhik Prasad Gupta, R/o- 52 Bigha, P.S.- 
Madhupur, Dist- Deoghar, JH. & SM/MDP, CTI/MDP. Found that the booked parcel 
is not Manihari Goods, it is Pan Masala & Jarda & prepared a joint note in this 
regard. It is found that this is false declaration of said booked items. In this regard 
the above items have been seized in presence of available witnesses from the 
possession of custodian(CPS/MDP) in presence of representative of sender. During 
seizing weighting of the items has been done & found total 940 kg only, 
counted total items & MRP value that is mentioned in seizure list prepared. Total 
value is 873600/- rupees.   
 As per requisition received a/w PRRs from receiver/representatives of 
booked parcel namely Pranesh Gupta, Male- 38 yrs. about, S/o- Lt. Abhik Prasad 
Gupta, R/o- 52 Bigha, P.S.- Madhupur, Dist- Deoghar, JH forwarded by CPS/MDP 
in which mentioned that the above items booked at BSB as Manihari Goods, 
declared wrong mistakenly. While the booked item is Pan Masala & Jarda & 
requested to hand over the said items.  
 As per joint note prepared in this regard, a case no.- 2157/2024, u/s- 163 
RA, Dt.- 16.11.2023 is registered against absconded Shivam-Morena BSB & 
enquiry is endorsed to SI/Shyam Sundar Kumar of RPF Post MDP. 

18.11.24 “Operation Satark”:-On 18.11.2024, an intensify drive/preventive check 
conducted by the team of D&I wing/HQ with assistance of D&I Wing/ASN against  
illegal transporting of contraband items and liquid cash by mail/express trains as 
well as station premises in view of Assembly Election of Jharkhand State which 
may be used in election purpose. During such drive, on creditable source & 
information of HC/Abhijit Bag of D&I Wing/HQ/ER, checked front side general 
coach No. ER 112421 OF T/No-13185 UP (Gangasagar Exp.) after departure from 
Asansol Railway Station from 02.30 hrs. During checking,  the team  noticed that 
05 nos. Big cartoons wrapped with plastic chat & 01 big plastic bag kept under the 
seat in suspicious condition. Firstly, several efforts have been made amongst the 
passengers to trace out the actual owner of these cartoons/bag but in vain. 
However, the passengers seated on the berth where the items kept, were 
interrogated regarding loading station of the articles but nobody replied about it. 
On the suspicious ground we checked the cartoons & bag and found that it was 



full with Foreign made liquors & Bears.  On arrival of the said train at Jamtara 
Railway station at about 03.20 hrs. of 18.11.2024, the said cartoons & bag 
brought down from the said compartment on PF No-01 (JSME end). Again, waited 
for the its actual owner but no one turned up to claim it. Hence, found no 
alternative way, the cartoons and bags were opened in presence of available 
witnesses and found 03 small cartoons in each big cartoons i.e. total 15 cartoons. 
Out of which, 48 nos. Officer Choice Elite Whiskey tetra pack/180 ml each (Price 
Rs. 130/- each tetra pack) in 14 cartoons and 38 nos. Officer Choice Elite Whiskey 
tetra pack/180 ml (Price Rs. 130/- each tetra pack)  in 01 cartoon, i.e. Total 710 
tetra pack valued Rs. 92,300/- and 07 packets contained 06 nos. of Haywards 
5000 Premium Strong Bear in each packet(500 ml each, printed price Rs. 110/-
/each) kept  in 01 nos. Big size plastic bag  i.e. total 42 nos. Cane bear valued Rs. 
4620/-. Grand Total -148.8 ltrs and valued Rs. 96,920/-.  Thereafter, seized all 
the above articles on the spot from 03.50 hrs. To 04.30 hrs. under proper seizure 
list in presence of available witness as unclaimed & handed over to 
RPF/Post/Jamtara for taking legal action in purview of law.  
All legal formalities were done and information was given to Excise Department of 
Jamtara. Finally following due documentation the seized liquors were handed over 
to the Excise Department of Jamtara for its further legal disposal. 

 
16.11.24 “Operation Satark”:-On 16.11.2024   on receipt of source information  at 

about 16:05 hrs contacted IPF/Rampurhat regarding interception of suspect of 
carrying illegal cash in train No-13015 and attended the train on arrival at Dumka 
at about 16:50 hrs with officer and staffof Dumka Railway station when a person  
was detrained and  detained by Officer and Staff of RPF/Post/RPH, SI Surojit 
Sarkar, ASI Guddu Kumar SI Mishra, Hans Raj IPF/RPH, Ravi Yadav IPF/CIB/HWH, 
Rajat Ranjan IPF/CIB/BWN with staffs under supervision of R. K. Sao ASC 
/Rampurhat. It is found out during enquiry that team was   active to work out an 
input regarding carrying of cash from Rampurhat to Dumka area. The team 
attended Rampurhat station and kept close watch on two suspected persons at 
Platform number -2 at about 15.10 hrs and later both the persons were seen 
boarding in train No.13015 Kaviguru express (HWH-Jamalpur) express in D-2 
coach. The train left Rampurhat at 15.31hrs. In course of checking in D-2 coach 
one passenger was found travelling in suspicious condition in 27 & 28 and his 
other companion was not found at his seat. The individual appeared to be in a 
nervous and suspicious state, was immediately placed under surveillance by the 



team. Upon further monitoring, he attempted to avoid detection and tried to leave 
but the team chased and proceed with a search. He was detained and n 
interrogation he disclosed his identity as mentioned above. Upon further enquiry 
about belongings, he eventually admitted that he was carrying He was carrying a 
large sum of cash Rs. 40.9 Lakh in his blue coloured trolley bag with one black 
colour bag pack  (pitthu bag). By the time the train crossed Sikari Para station at 
about 16.16hrs. Immediately matter was informed to Sr.DSC(CO)/HWH sir and the 
person with cash was detrained at Dumka. As per advise of Sr. DSC sir, contact 
was made with nodal officer Dumka  IT over phone Mr.Pankaj Kumar at 16.39 hrs. 
who shared the number of IT official Mr. Rakesh Kumar of Dumka at 16.49 hrs. 
Contact was made with him and he along with his team arrived Dumka station 
at18.18 hrs.   Detail enquiry was carried out by IT officials as per IT Law, 
recording of statement of the detained person, counting and sealing of cash etc 
was done till 20.35hrs.The person has been interrogated by IT officials and 
recorded his statement. Inventory of was made regarding the recovered cash and 
the recovered money i.e Rs.40.9 Lakhs has been kept in safe custody of RPF 
Post Dumka under armed guards  till enquiry by IT officials.  

On 18.11.2024 contacted with Sri Rakesh Kumar, Income Tax 
Officer/Dumka, Quick response Team/ Dumka regarding the case when he inform 
that  warrant has not been issued for deposition of the Cash by the higher 
authorities of IT/Dumka till now. 

 
18.11.24 Operation Ammanat:- On date one person namely Sandip Sharma m 34 yrs s/o 

Kameshwar Sharma of qtr 5/12,Antipathy c-zone Durgapur having mobile no 
8001008061submitted written application and claimed left behind bag containing 
two Which was recovered by ASI/ Md. H R Laskar(A shift DO)of RPF West Post 
ASN from T/no- 12351up and kept under the charge of TA duty.On being asked 
he stated that he was traveling from HWH to DGR by 12351 up.total value of the 
bag Rs 80000/-. After proper verification and documentation the said bag handed 
over to actual owner.He given thanks to RPF department. 



 
20.11.24 “Operation Ammanat”:-Acting on a Rail madad complaint vide ref no: 

2024112004360 RPF officer assisted the complainant to get an FIR with GRPS/ 
ASN. it was alleged that passenger on berth no 28 got down at JSME. 
On efforts by RPF D.O ASI A K Singh the alleged passenger was connected and 
the  
 one black coloured Pitthu bag, (containing in HP Laptop) was recovered. 
Complainant Sumita Singh, S/O-Surendra Prasad Singh, Of-Road no-01,Opp-Ajay 
Kumar Memorial Hospital, Rajendra Nagar, in Patna,Bihar,800016 is called at RPF 
/post/ASN. He  identified his bag containing HP Laptop , charger, money purse 
valuable documents total valued Rs 90000/-.  All the items are handed over to him 
after proper verification and documentation 

 

 
21.11.24 “Operation Jeevan Raksha”:-  

On 21.11 2024 at about 13.56 hrs T/ no 18183 (Ara  TATA super Exp) departured 
from PF 2, MDP Station. At this time one old passenger tried to board in  running 
motion of train resulting which he lost his balance and hanging on train  and fallen 
in the gap of train and PF. On seeing this, ASI/Narendra Kumar who was detailed 
for special watch duty against TOPB and on duty C/Bablu Kumar immediately 
attended and saved the life of said old passenger .   Due to this incident the said 
passengers was  saved from any injury. On being asked  he disclosed his as Md 
Rustam Sheikh M- 65 Yrs S/O Rajbali Sheikh of R/O :-Kurmidih PS :- Madhupur 
Dist :- Deoghar , Mb No- 9835096038 having ticket no UTX 60992375 and 
6099376 ex  MDP to Jamui and travelling a/w his daughter.    
Due to this prompt action of RPF/Post/MDP, saved the life of the  said bonafied 
passenger. RPF/MDP not only save a precious life but also averted disruption of 
train Movement.  The above work will create a good image of RPF among the 
commuters of Indian Railway. 



 
24.11.24 “Operation Jeevan Raksha”:- On 24.11.2024, ASI/Kumar Sahil of RPF Post 

JSME a/w staff was engaged in Train passing and passenger security. During duty 
when T/No. 03573 started from Jasidih Railway station at at about 11:20 hrs, they 
noticed that one passenger was trying to board in running and fell down in the 
gap of JSME platform and Railway track. Further on seeing they shouted and told 
the train guard to stop the train. Accordingly, the train stopped and the said 
passenger was rescued by ASI/Kumar Sahil with the help of RPF/Staff. In this 
regard a memo issued by SM/JSME Vide No. Nil, Dated. 24.11.2024. On being 
asked, he disclosed his identity as Ramnarayan Pandey, S/O- Lt. Kishundev 
Pandey, R/O- Vill- Baruatta, PS- Jamui, Dist- Jamui, Bihar. And also stated that he 
was travelling from Jasidih to Jhajha with his friend namely Nishikant Singh, R/O- 
Chuhat, Sono, Jamui, Bihar During boarding in the running train he got minor 
injury in his head. Further, ASI Kumar Sahil called a private Riksha and send him 
Pagla Baba Hospital/Jasidih a/w CT/Sunil Kumar of RPF/Post/Jasidih for treatment. 
After treatment he realised from hospital and went to his home in good condition. 

02.12.24 Operation Sewa:- On 02.12.2024 at about 16:45 hrs on duty SM/Paraj Sri 
Vikash Kumar informed to on duty OP/Camp/RPF/Paraj staff HC/Nakimuddin 
Biswas that one unknown passenger aged about 25 yrs. was lying in ill condition 
near at booking office at Paraj station. Immediately he rushed the spot and found 
the same. In this regard, SM/PAJ issued a memo vide No. SM/PAJ/B/03/24 dated 
02.12.2024 at 16:45 hrs. addressed to Medical Superintendent/Pursha Hospital. 
Then on duty RPF staff of OP/Camp/PAJ with the help of on duty porter of Paraj 
Station Sri D. Soren rescued him and brought him to Pursha Gramin Hospital by 
private TOTO and they further referred to him at BPSC Hospital (Galsi-1 Block) for 
his treatment. Later on, examined the ill person and released him after proper 
examined and first aid. On being searched by on duty porter, found one voter ID 
Card vide No. UHI/2029502 from the possession of ill person. As per voter ID card 
the ill person identified as Prasenjit Aditya (M/28 yrs0 S/O. Paritosh Aditya , R/O. 
Gopalpur, South Gopalpur, Kotawali, Coochbehar-736133 (WB). On being asked 
he disclosed his identity as Prasenjit Aditya (M/28 yrs0 S/O. Paritosh Aditya, R/O. 
Gopalpur, South Gopalpur, Kotawali, Coochbehar-736133 (WB). He is alive and fit 
now and he wants to go his house. No any railway journey ticket found from his 
possession. 

04.12.24 Inspector Kishun Prasad, in-charge of Chittranjan P.P., Railway Police Station 
Madhupur (P.P. Chittaranjan) Case No. 57/2024 dated- 04.12.2024 under Section-
25 (1-b)a/26 Arms Act, FIR was registered against accused Surendra Hadi, age 27 
years, son of Jogesh Hadi, resident of Mihijam Hadi Pada P.P. Road Nanik Pada, 
Police Station Mihijam, District Jamtara, Jharkhand and the investigation of the 
case was handed over to Sub-Inspector Anup Kumar singh. Summary of the 
statement- I, Sub-Inspector Kishun Prasad, am presently posted as in-charge in 
Chitarjan P.P. I record my own statement today on 04/12/2024 at around 00.30 
pm at platform number- 02/03 Chittaranjan Railway Station that today on 
04.12.2024, I myself, along with Sub Inspector Kishun Prasad Incharge, Railway 



PP Chittaranjan, along with Sub Inspector Ravindra Kumar Singh, Sub Inspector 
Santosh Kumar, Constable / 240 Dheeraj Kumar, Constable 39 Naresh Kumar Jha 
and RPF Constable Ashutosh Mishra, were conducting a special checking 
campaign. During the special checking campaign at about 00.10 hrs, a person was 
standing near Gupta Store at Chittaranjan railway station platform no. 02/03, 
whose activities seemed suspicious. On questioning him, he told his name as 
Surendra Hadi, age 27 years, son of Jogesh Hadi, resident of Mihijam Hadi Pada, 
PP Road, Malik Pada, Police Station Mihijam, District Jamtara. On being asked the 
reason for roaming around the station premises, he did not tell anything 
satisfactory and seemed to be scared. As it was night and no independent witness 
was present, then after allowing his proper search to Constable / 240 Dheeraj 
Kumar and Constable / 39 Neeraj Kumar Jha present in the checking team, the 
suspect Surendra Hadi was arrested When duly searched, a loaded country made 
pistol was found in the jeans pant worn by Surendra Hadi near his waist, which 
had one bullet loaded in it. On demanding valid documents regarding the 
recovered firearm and on asking the reason for keeping the firearm, he did not 
give any satisfactory answer. The barrel length of the recovered country made 
pistol is 6 inches, butt length is about 4 inches and body length is about 5 inches 
in which one cartridge is loaded, on unloading which 8. MMKF was found written 
on the cartridge cover. During further search, a Redmi mobile was recovered from 
a pocket of Jeans Pat, whose number is 9608404329. One country made pistol, 
one live bullet and one mobile were seized after duly preparing the seizure list in 
front of the checking team members constable 240 Dheeraj Kumar and constable 
39 Neeraj Kumar Jha and sealed and packed at the spot. The person who was 
caught, Surendra Hadi, was arrested after preparing a formal arrest warrant. I 
charge the person Surendra Hadi, 27 years, son of Jogesh Hadi, resident of 
Mihijam Hadi Pada, PP Road, Malik Pada, Police Station Mihijam, District Jamtara, 
Jharkhand, under Section 25 (1-b) a/26 of the Arms Act, for roaming in the station 
premises with an illegally loaded country-made pistol with the intention of 
committing a crime. 

08.12.24 Operation Amanat:- on 08.12.24 getting 139 complaint regarding left behind 
one backpack in train no. 17321 by one passenger namely Beauty Kumari (28), 
S/O- Rama Shankar Singh of Mukhdumpur, Jehanabad (Bihar)- 804422 who was 
travelling in above train (PNR No. 4410962754, M-2, Berth No. 35) de boarded at 
DHN station leaving his backpack containing 02 nos Laptops, Gold jewellery etc. 
Talked with the complainant over phone accordingly, on duty staff of RPF Post 
Barakar attended the train and after intense searching got able to recover the bag 
from the said coach. Immediately, the matter was informed to the passenger 
concerned who came in the RPF Post Barakar on 08.12.24 at about 09.00 hrs and 
the recovered backpack containing 02 nos Laptops, Gold jewellery etc. has been 
handed over to him in as usual condition after proper documentation and 
verification. Total value of recovered articles is Rs. 4,00,000/- (approx). 

11.12.24 “Operetion MatriShakti”:- On date 11/12/2024 at about 22:30 hrs massage 
has received from SCNL ASN regarding one pregnant lady passenger  traveling in 



train no 13158 Express. in GS coach. Accordingly officers & staff of RPF post 
Asansol west, GRPS ASN, Dy SS ASN and Dr of Gouri Devi Hospital attended. After 
examined by Doctor of Gouri Devi Hospital advice immediately admit at Hospital 
due to labour pain. In this regard DySS Asansol issued memo vide no 
SM/ASN/22/2024 Dt 11.12.24 and said Pregnant lady sent to SD Hospital ASN by 
Railway Ambulance with escort Lady constable Dipa Das of RPF West Post Asansol 
and GRP staff ASN.Further enquired Name of said lady as Amita Khatun aged 
about 27 yrs W/O Afzal R/O kisanganj PO-Singhia,PS- Parkata, Admitted SD 
Hospital observation bed no 01 under treatment by Dr.Srikanta. 

18.12.24 Operation Amanat:- On date 18.12.2024 based on rail madad complain vide 
reference no -2024121805804 about left behind luggage containing one Laptop 
value (01 Lakhs), 02 Realme mobile phone value (26,000/-) and etc total approx 
value 1,26,000 Rs. After such information myself along with on duty staff searched 
and found the above articles at above mentioned place and further brought to 
RPF/Post/Madhupur and kept in safe custody. Further as per written application by 
complainant namely Rekha Yadav , one person came to the post namely Sanjit 
Kumar Jha who gave written application for handover the said recovered article 
because complainant is his friend. After proper verification, documentation and 
made conversation with comolainant and as per both application, the recovered 
items were handed over to his friend. In this regards the complainant gave thanks 
to RPF/MDP.  

21.12.24 OPERATION "SEWA" :- On 21.12.2024 at about 00-30 hrs one passenger 
appeared before RPF POST MDP to report regarding fallen down of his father from 
train before entering MDP Stn. Immediately myself ASI S. Kamal a/w ASI D. P. 
Sinha CT D. Sah and the victim 's son Md Sunny left for searching the Rly track. 
About 500 mtrs from MDP Stn he found fallen beside up Rly track. Immediately he 
was rescued and brought him to Rly health unit MDP for medical assistance where 
the medical facility was provided. On asking the victim passenger, he disclosed his 
name as Md Aman(M 52yrs) S/O-Lt Md. Amin R/O-Buriakhad, PS-Muffasil, Dist-
Giridih (JH) and was travelling from NH to MDP in GS coach vide ticket no-UTV-
85234019 and when the train became slow, he felt the train has reached MDP 
station and he tried to get down and resulting the incident happened. He has not 
blamed any one and admitted his fault and due to the prompt action by RPF MDP 
he was saved and he thanked to RPF MDP for prompt action. 

22.12.24 Operation Amanat:- On 22.12.2024 at about 19:20 hrs. in compliance to a Rail 
Madad received from SCNL Asansol vide ref no 2024122207891 regarding left 
behind of a black & grey colour bag containing 2 nos. of Laptop, 03 diary, 01 
wallet, driving license, voter card, chargers etc at Durgapur Railway station PF no 
04, and the complainant boarded in Train no. 22304 DN Vande Bharat Express 
Accordingly, on receipt of such complain ASI S N Ram a/w on duty staff namely 
LC/Shivani Devi conducted search as per location provided by the complainant and 
managed to recovered the same. Further the matter has been informed to the 
complainant. Further at about 21:15 hrs one person namely Bappa Mete age-
33yrs, S/O- Dinbandhu Mete R/O- 4/2 J.N Das Path City center, Durgapur, 



713216, Mobile no-9734218636, attended this post to collect the same on behalf 
of the complainant. In this regard he submitted a written application to hand over 
the recovered bag. Therefore, after proper verification the said recovered bag 
containing (two laptop, two charger, one brown wallet inside cash Rs1010, 3 
diaries, one pan card, voter identity, driving licence) have been properly handed 
over to him under proper documentation. Total value of the recovered bag is Rs. 
2,50,000/-  

22.12.24 Operation Amanat:- On 22.12.2024 at about 19:20 hrs. in compliance to a Rail 
Madad received from SCNL Asansol vide ref no 2024122207891 regarding left 
behind of a black & grey colour bag containing 2 nos. of Laptop, 03 diary, 01 
wallet, driving license, voter card, chargers etc at Durgapur Railway station PF no 
04, and the complainant boarded in Train no. 22304 DN Vande Bharat Express 
Accordingly, on receipt of such complain ASI S N Ram a/w on duty staff namely 
LC/Shivani Devi conducted search as per location provided by the complainant and 
managed to recovered the same. Further the matter has been informed to the 
complainant. Further at about 21:15 hrs one person namely Bappa Mete age-
33yrs, S/O- Dinbandhu Mete R/O- 4/2 J.N Das Path City center, Durgapur, 
713216, Mobile no-9734218636, attended this post to collect the same on behalf 
of the complainant. In this regard he submitted a written application to hand over 
the recovered bag. Therefore, after proper verification the said recovered bag 
containing (two laptop, two charger, one brown wallet inside cash Rs1010, 3 
diaries, one pan card, voter identity, driving licence) have been properly handed 
over to him under proper documentation. Total value of the recovered bag is Rs. 
2,50,000/- In this regard dairy made vide No. 45 at 21:30 hrs. 

30.12.24 Recovered of Unaccounted Cash:- On 30.12.2024 after arrival of train No-
13016 at Dumka, ASI/Mithilesh Kumar of RPF/Post/BGP along with staff who were 
detailed for train  escorting duty Ex-BGP to Dumka. Appeared at RPF/POST/Dumka 
along with 02 person and one Pittu Bag and reported that train No-13016 left 
Bhagalpur at 08:03 hrs. In course of checking in S-1 coach two passengers were 
found travelling in suspicious condition in 3 & 6. The individual appeared to be in a 
nervous and suspicious state, was immediately placed under surveillance by the 
escort Party and proceed with a search. He was detained and during interrogation 
they disclosed their identity as i) Harsh Kumar, Male-22 yrs, S/O-Sanjay Kumar 
Sah, R/O-Munger, PS-Munger, Dist-Munger(Bihar) & ii) Manish Kumar Sah, Male-
24 yrs. S/O—Pramod Sah, R/O-Gangasagar, PS+Dist-Godda (Jharkhand) and 
handing over it to IT officials of Dumka.  
Upon further enquiry about belongings, he eventually admitted that they were 
carrying a large sum of cash Rs. 28.5 Lakh in his black colour bag pack  (pitthu 
bag) and the person with cash was detrained at Dumka and brought to 
RPF/POST/Dumka and informed the matter to the competent authority.  
As per advise of competent authority, contact was made with nodal officer Dumka  
IT over phone. Later, IT official Mr. Rakesh Kumar of Dumka along with his team 
arrived Dumka station at18.45 hrs.  Detail enquiry was carried out by IT officials 
as per IT Law, recording of statement of the detained person, wherein both 



person stated that carrying amount is 28.5 lakh but after counting it was 
27.50 lakh. Counting and sealing of cash etc was done till 21:00 hrs. The 
persons have been interrogated by IT officials and recorded his statement. 
Inventory of was made regarding the recovered cash and the recovered money i.e 
Rs.27.50 Lakhs  has been kept in safe custody of RPF Post Dumka under armed 
guards  till enquiry by IT officials. 

 
 


